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Student: 
I have read and agree to abide by the Student Technology Acceptable Use and Safety Policy and Guidelines. I 
understand that any violation of the terms and conditions set forth in the Policy and Guidelines is inappropriate and 
may constitute a criminal offense and/or may result in disciplinary action. As a user of St. Andrew Catholic School 
Technology Resources, I agree to communicate over the Internet and through the Technology Resources in an 
appropriate manner, honoring all relevant laws, restrictions and guidelines.   

Student's Printed Name/Signature: ____________________________________________ Date:_____________________ 

Student’s Printed Name/Signature: ____________________________________________ Date:_____________________ 

Parent/Guardian: As the parent/guardian of this student, I have read the Student Technology Acceptable Use and 
Safety Policy and Guidelines, and have discussed them with my child. I understand that student access to the Internet 
is designed for educational purposes and that St. Andrew Catholic School has taken available precautions to restrict 
and/or control student access to material on the Internet that is obscene, objectionable, inappropriate and/or harmful 
to minors. However, I recognize that it is impossible for St. Andrew Catholic School to restrict access to all 
objectionable and/or controversial materials that may be found on the Internet. I will not hold St. Andrew Catholic 
School (or any of its employees, administrators or officers) responsible for materials my child may acquire or come in 
contact with while on the Internet. Additionally, I accept responsibility for communicating to my child guidance 
concerning his/her acceptable use of the Internet - i.e., setting and conveying standards for my daughter/son to 
follow when selecting, sharing and exploring information and resources on the Internet. I further understand that 
individuals and families may be liable for violations. 

Parent(s) PRINTED Name:  (Family Last Name and Student Last Name(s):______________________________________ 

Parent(s) Signature: __________________________________________ 

Teachers and building principals are responsible for determining what is unauthorized or inappropriate use. The 
principal may deny, revoke or suspend access to and use of the Technology Resources to individuals who violate the 
St. Andrew Catholic School Student Technology Acceptable Use and Safety Policy and related Guidelines, and take 
such other disciplinary action as is appropriate pursuant to the Student Code of Conduct. 

DIOCESE OF VENICE 
AUTHORIZATION FOR RELEASE AND USE OF STUDENT IMAGE IN PHOTO, VIDEO FILES 
OR OTHER MEDIA  

Registering at Saint Andrew Catholic School constitutes consent for school and DOV Authorization for Release of 
Student Image in Photo, Video File or Other Media.  

I, the undersigned parent/legal guardian of a minor student(s) hereby grant to Saint Andrew Catholic School the 
following irrevocable rights: 
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